
$314,900 - 228 Cadieux
 

Listing ID: M157504

$314,900
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 665 square feet
Single Family

228 Cadieux, Moncton, New Brunswick,
E1A0V3

NEW CONSTRUCTION. Welcome to your
dream home! This brand new construction
split entry semi-detached home is the
epitome of modern living, combining style,
functionality, and comfort. Upstairs you'll
find the stunning open-concept living space.
The white kitchen offers a clean and
timeless look and is equipped with ample
storage. The kitchen seamlessly flows into
the expansive living and dining area,
creating the ideal space for entertaining
friends and family. Step onto your private
balcony, to enjoy your morning coffee or a
relaxing evening. The main floor also
features a half bathroom with laundry area.
The lower level boasts three well-appointed
bedrooms each providing ample closet
space and natural light. The full bathroom
on this level features modern fixtures and a
sleek aesthetic. Mini split on the main floor
is included. paved driveway, top soil and
seed to be included but will hold no
warranties. 7 year LUX New Home
warranty included in the purchase price.
(Renderings and floor plans are sample
only. Colours and materials of exterior
finishes may vary). Estimated completion
date - Winter 2025. Call your REALTOR®
for more details. (id:24320)
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