
$319,900 - 207 Cadieux ST
 

Listing ID: M157670

$319,900
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 672 square feet
Single Family

207 Cadieux ST, Moncton, New Brunswick,
E1A0A3

READY END OF SUMMER 2024!!
Welcome to 207 Cadieux Street in
Moncton. LOCATED IN THE POPULAR
STERLING MEADOWS SUBDIVISION!!
AFFORDABLE NEW CONSTRUCTION!!
FULLY FINISHED 3 BEDROOM 1.5
BATH SEMI DETACHED!! KITCHEN
APPLIANCES INCLUDED!! PHOTOS
ARE SAMPLE PHOTOS ONLY!! The
open concept floor plan of this beautiful
home is perfect for entertaining and features
a bright living room, kitchen with island and
dining area with access to the back deck. A
half bath with laundry completes the main
floor. The lower level offers the primary
bedroom, 2 additional bedrooms and a full
bath. This highly energy efficient home has
additional insulation and a mini-split heat
pump for year-round comfort. This property
is in a fantastic location close to all
amenities including schools, restaurants,
Champlain Mall, Downtown, highway,
Airport and Costco. HST rebate and NB
Power grant assigned to builder on closing.
Purchase price is based on the home being
the primary residence of the buyer. PID,
PAN, lot size and postal code are subject to
change. Colours of exterior finishes may
vary. Call for more information or to book
your private viewing. (id:24320)
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