
$179,900 - 2 Fort ST
 

Listing ID: M159861

$179,900
4 Bedrooms, 1 Bathrooms, 1546 square feet
Single Family

2 Fort ST, Port Elgin, New Brunswick,
E4M1L5

Beautiful large character home in
Downtown Port Elgin with WATERVIEWS
of Gasborough River. Great starter home or
summer home. Close to beautiful beaches
and warm waters of the Northumberland
Strait If you appreciate woodmanship
Original woodwork throughout, hardwood
flooring with some TLC would certainly
bring this property back to life. This home
Features enclosed porch on front, large
Foyer entrance. Generous size eat in
kitchen, formal dining room. Spacious
living room as well as a laundry area and
back door enclosed porch. 2nd level boasts
4 generous sized bedroom with sunroom
over looking the river. Great value and next
to the Trans Canada trail, great for hiking,
biking relaxing with nature. Walking
distance to all amenities. Contact your
REALTOR® for more information.
(id:24320)
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