
$219,900 - 28 de L'Eglise
 

Listing ID: M160216

$219,900
2 Bedrooms, 1 Bathrooms, 857 square feet
Single Family

28 de L'Eglise, Bouctouche, New
Brunswick, E4S2Z8

Welcome to 28 Rue de l'Église in
Bouctouche. This charming 1.5-storey home
is perfectly situated in the heart of
Bouctouche. The main floor features a good-
sized kitchen and dining area, a cozy living
room, and a full bathroom. The upper level
includes two comfortable bedrooms, ideal
for a small family or as a cozy retreat. The
basement is unfinished, providing ample
storage space. Outside, you'll find a paved
driveway and a storage shed, adding to the
property's convenience. Located within
walking distance to both a French
elementary school and a high school, this
home is perfect for families. You are also
just minutes away from local restaurants, a
farmer's market, walking trails, a marina, a
golf course, sandy dunes, and the famous
Pays de la Sagouine. With its prime location
under 40 minutes to Moncton, 28 Rue de
l'Église offers both the charm of small-town
living and the convenience of nearby urban
amenities. (id:24320)
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