
$369,900 - 77 Lancefield CRES
 

Listing ID: M160710

$369,900
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1400 square feet
Single Family

77 Lancefield CRES, Moncton, New
Brunswick, E1E0E7

OPEN CONCEPT, BUILT IN 2013,
MASSIVE PRIMARY BEDROOM WITH
WALK-IN CLOSET, HARDWOOD
FLOOR! Welcome to 77 Lancefield Cres,
located in the most sought-after
neighborhood in Moncton North. This
immaculate semi-detached home boasts an
excellent location and pristine condition.
Upon entering, you'll be greeted by an
OPEN CONCEPT main level featuring a
spacious living room, a dining area that can
accommodate a large table, and a kitchen
equipped with stainless steel appliances and
an island. This level also includes a
convenient 2-piece bathroom. The kitchen
leads to a beautifully landscaped backyard,
perfect for relaxation or entertaining. The
top floor offers three generously sized and
beautiful bedrooms, along with a spacious
and well-appointed bathroom featuring dual
sinks. The PRIMARY BEDROOM is
massive and includes a walk-in closet.
Hardwood floors extend throughout the
main and second levels, adding to the
home's elegance. The basement provides
additional living space with a family room,
a laundry room, and an office. Don't miss
the opportunity to own this exceptional
property. Schedule your viewing today!
(id:24320)
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