
$349,900 - 549 Amirault ST
 

Listing ID: M160863

$349,900
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1250 square feet
Single Family

549 Amirault ST, Dieppe, New Brunswick,
E1A1E6

Welcome to 549 Amirault Street in Dieppe.
This beautifully renovated brick bungalow
will not disappoint. As you pull up to the
house you will be greeted by a brand new 3
season enclosed porch. As you enter the
home you will notice the brand new, two
toned kitchen, with oversized center island
and large hood exhaust above the stove.
From there you will see the open dinning
room and living room with ample space and
lots of natural light. The primary bedroom is
the larger of the 3 bedrooms you will find
upstairs. The Bathroom is brand new with
new vanity and shower/bathtub. Downstairs
you will find a large Rec room, powder
room, laundry hook ups and non
conforming bedroom. With separate
entrance and some unfinished space this
could easily be converted to a in law suite.
This one will not last long so reach out to
your favourite Realtor and book a showing!
Property Taxes are non-owner occupied.
(id:24320)
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