
$539,000 - 50 Carter ST
 

Listing ID: M161110

$539,000
3 Bedrooms, 3 Bathrooms, 1696 square feet
Single Family

50 Carter ST, Dieppe, New Brunswick,
E1A0G4

Step into your dream home through the
convenient side entrance, where you'll be
greeted by a well-organized custom
mudroom. This stunning new build in
Dieppe, New Brunswick, offers 9' main
floor ceilings and a spacious open-concept
layout designed for modern living. From the
mudroom, walk into the heart of the home: a
sleek kitchen featuring luxurious marble
countertops, custom white cabinetry, a
central island with pendant lighting, and a
walk-in pantry. The kitchen flows
seamlessly into the cozy living area, where
an electric fireplace adds warmth and
ambiance. Large windows in the living and
dining areas flood the space with natural
light, creating an inviting atmosphere. Head
upstairs to discover the serene master suite,
complete with a walk-in closet and a
luxurious 4-piece ensuite bath. Two
additional spacious bedrooms provide
plenty of room for family or guests, and a
second full bath ensures convenience for all.
The upper level also features a practical
laundry room, making chores a breeze.
Outside, enjoy the tranquility of the treed
backyard from the 12X12 rear deck, perfect
for entertaining or relaxing. The 16X6 front
porch offers another charming spot to
unwind and enjoy the peaceful
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neighborhood. Additional features include
ducted central heating and cooling, 2.5
baths, and ample storage space. Nestled in a
quiet neighborhood that combines rural
living with urban convenience, this home is
truly a gem. Don't miss the opportunity to
make it yours! (id:24320)
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